
Clubs

S. No. Clubs

1 Finnacle

2 Mark8Inc

3 Operencia

4 HRizon

5 Intellectia

6 Eloquence

7 Earthwise



Mark8Inc

CO - HEAD
SARIKA NANGIA

CO - HEAD
ASHIMA MODI

Mark8Inc, the Marketing Club of SVKM's NMIMS
Hyderabad, is the powerhouse of creative
marketing minds, fostering innovation, strategic
thinking, and brand excellence. The club
curates dynamic events, industry interactions,
and hands-on experiences that challenge
students to think beyond textbooks and apply
real-world marketing strategies.

Page 32 | Committees and Clubs

Operencia

Operencia, the Operations Club at SVKM’s
NMIMS Hyderabad, is the driving force behind
operational excellence and supply chain
mastery. Focused on bridging the gap
between theory and real-world applications,
the club fosters analytical thinking, process
optimization and strategic decision-making.
Through industry visits, case competitions and
insightful discussions, Operencia empowers
students to navigate complex business
challenges with precision and efficiency. With
a commitment to innovation and excellence,
the club plays a crucial role in shaping future
operations leaders

CO - HEAD
VISHRUTH REDDY

CO - HEAD
KARISHMA GUGLANI
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Intellectia

CO - HEAD
ANUSHKA KOTHATKAR

CO - HEAD
HIMANISH MUDGAL

Welcome to Intellectia, where ideas transform
into impactful research! We are a hub for
curious minds, fostering analytical thinking,
industry insights, and thought leadership. Join
us in decoding trends, challenging norms, and
shaping the future through research.
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HRizon

CO - HEAD
MEGHNA NAIR

CO - HEAD
DEVADARSAN M

At HRizon, we create opportunities for students
to explore, engage, and excel in the field of
human resources. The club actively organizes
and manages HR-focused events, career-
building sessions, industry interactions, and fun,
insightful activities that bring HR concepts to
life. By bridging the gap between academics
and industry, HRizon equips students with the
skills and exposure needed to thrive in the
evolving world of human resources.
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Eloquence

CO - HEAD
KLEVIN PASCAL

CO - HEAD
KHUSHI NAIB

Earthwise

The Communication Club of NMIMS Hyderabad
is a dynamic platform for students to refine
their public speaking, debating, and
storytelling skills. The club fosters confidence,
creativity, and persuasive communication
through engaging workshops, speech contests,
and interactive sessions. Whether you’re an
aspiring speaker, a passionate debater, or
simply looking to enhance your articulation,
Eloquence offers the perfect space to grow.
With a blend of fun activities and skill-building
exercises, we help students master the art of
impactful communication.

CO - HEAD
AMAN RAGHUVANSHI

CO - HEAD
SHIVANG GUPTA

The Sustainability Club at SVKM’s NMIMS
Hyderabad is committed to fostering a culture
of sustainability and green living on campus.
Focused on awareness about the SDGs, water
conservation, recycling, and reusing resources,
the club drives impactful initiatives that inspire
students to adopt eco-friendly habits. Through
engaging campaigns, plantation drives, and
sustainability challenges, Earthwise actively
promotes responsible consumption and
environmental stewardship. 
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CO - HEAD
KLEVIN PASCAL

Finnacle

CO - HEAD
SIDDHI SHIRKE

CO - HEAD
HARSHIT KALRA

Finance Club of NMIMS Hyderabad, is a
vibrant community dedicated to nurturing
financial expertise and industry readiness. The
club fosters financial acumen, practical skills
and an analytical mindset through engaging
events, competitions and industry interactions.
With a vision to be a premier hub for finance
activities, Finnacle connects students with
experts and equips them with the tools to
become future financial leaders.
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